BID TAB FOR HIGHWAY SALT Bid No. 18-F-0008 Bid Opening Date May 2 2018 @ 3pm
VENDOR Do ‘ngas C‘ountv Wakarusa Township Cit‘ of Ott‘awa Cit‘ of Baldwin Franklin County City of Lecompton City of Eudora City of Lawrence

Qty | $/Ton Qty | $/Ton Qty | $/Ton Qty | $/Ton Qty | $/Ton Qty |$/Ton Qty |$/Ton Qty |$/Ton
Compass 3000 No Bid 250 No Bid 300 No Bid 125 No Bid 1200 No Bid 25 No Bid 75 No Bid 3500 No Bid
EnvironTech 3000 $255.00 $765,000.00| 250 | $255.00 $63,750.00] 300 | $255.00 $76,500.00] 125 | $255.00 $31,875.00] 1200] $255.00 $306,000.00] 25 |$255.00 $6,375.00] 75 | $255.00 $19,125.00] 3500] $255.00 $892,500.00
Central 3000 $47.58 $142,740.00] 250 | $53.55 $13,387.50] 300 | $53.55 $16,065.00] 125 | $53.55 $6,693.75] 1200| $52.67 $63,204.00] 25 | $53.55 $1,338.75] 75 | $53.55 $4,016.25] 3500| $47.58 $166,530.00
Hutchinson Salt 3000| $52.75 $158,250.00] 250 | $58.75 $14,687.50] 300 | $56.65 $16,995.00] 125 | $58.40 $7,300.00] 1200| $58.15 $69,780.00] 25 | $58.75 $1,468.75] 75 No Bid 3500 $52.75 $184,625.00
Independence Salt 3000| $46.85 $140,550.00] 250 No Bid 300 No Bid 125 No Bid 1200 No Bid 25 No Bid 75 No Bid 3500 $46.85 $163,975.00
Cargill 3000 No Bid 250 No Bid 300 No Bid 125 No Bid 1200 No Bid 25 No Bid 75 No Bid 3500 No Bid
Morton 3000 No Bid 250 No Bid 300 No Bid 125 No Bid 1200 No Bid 25 No Bid 75 No Bid 3500 No Bid

3000 250 300 125 1200 25 75 3500

3000 250 300 125 1200 25 75 3500

3000 250 300 125 1200 25 75 3500

3000 250 300 125 1200 25 75 3500

3000 250 300 125 1200 25 75 3500
Director of Public Works: Keith A. Browning County Clerk: Jamie Shew Date:
Laura Glass Heather Dill




